PURCHASING COMMITTEE

AUGUST 12, 2014

4:30 P.M.
MINUTES
MEMBERS PRESENT OTHERS
Ernest Burgess, Chairman Keith Powell
Jack Black Mac Nolen
Joyce Ealy Rob Mitchell
Carol Cook Darin Moore
Doug Shafer Brian Robertson
Allen McAdoo Barbara Marlin
Michael Gregory
Vicki Taylor

Chairman Burgess presided and called the meeting to order with six members present.

VARIOUS PROFESSIONAL SERVICES, INCLUDING NETWORK ADMINISTRATION |
& Il, DATABASE SERVICES, GIS SERVICES | &Il - OIT

The following bids were received on July 29, 2014 and taken under advisement:

True North  Pomeroy Presidio Wiser CoreBTS
Murf., TN Nashville Brentwood Murf., TN Franklin
1. Net. Adm. | -0- $125 $115 $93 $135
2. Net. Adm. Il -0- $165 $150 -0- $165
3. Database Ser. -0- $150 $175 -0- -
4. GIS Ser. | $84 -0- -0- $67 -0-
5. GIS Ser. Il $120.75 -0- -0- $76 -0-

Brian Robertson said he and his team had thoroughly reviewed all bids received and
would be making a recommendation for the main vendor and a secondary vendor to be
used in the event the first one is unavailable. All bidders had agreed to be the back-up
vendor if chosen as such.

For Network Administration | & Il, the low bid was submitted by Wiser Co.; however they
are not a Cisco Gold Partner and that is a requirement. Cisco is the provider of all our
network and internet systems. Mr. Robertson recommended Presidio for the primary
vendor for both and Pomeroy as the secondary should or if we need them.




“Commissioner Black moved, seconded by Commissioner Ealy, to approve Mr.
Robertson’s recommendation for Presidio as the primary vendor and Pomeroy as the
secondary. The motion passed unanimously.”

For Database Services, Mr. Robertson recommended Pomeroy as the primary and
Presidio as the secondary. He's worked with Pomeroy in the not-so-distant past and
was pleased with their work and they meet all specs.

“Commissioner Cook moved, seconded by Commissioner Shafer, to approve Mr.
Robertson’s recommendation for Pomeroy as the primary and Presidio as the
secondary for Database Services. The motion passed unanimously.”

For GIS | & II, Mr. Robertson said True North has been the provider, but he would like to
recommend the low bidder, Wiser Co., as the primary and True North as secondary.
Wiser Co. is locally owned and operated and is a very reputable business.

“Commissioner Black moved, seconded by Commissioner Ealy, to approve Mr.
Robertson’s recommendation and award the primary bid to Wiser Co. and secondary to
True North. The motion passed unanimously.”

UNIFORMS - EMS

Ted's Dorel CMS Bluegrass Image

Columbia Antioch Nash. Bowling Green Brentwood
Class A LS Shirt 24.50 6.95 28.25 28.15 NO BID
Class A SS Shirt 22.00 9.98 24.75 32.05 NO BID
Belts 14.50 17.25 16.00 VARIOUS NO BID
8" zipper boot 72.00 67.50 116.25 NO BID
6" zipper boot 82.00 63.75 102.30 NO BID
Winter jacket 44.00 39.95 48.00 43.60 31.48
Raincoat 35.00 34.50 38.00 39.75 41.00
Fleece jacket 35.00 30.25/30.35 NO BID 34.00 32.00
Cap NO BID 15.50 9.50 13.50 7.63
Toboggan NO BID 6.25 8.00 8.30 6.95
Beanie NO BID 5.95 8.00 8.70 6.15
EMS t-shirt SS NO BID NOBID 14.95 NO BID
EMS t-shirt LS NO BID NOBID 18.00 NO BID
Spec. Ops SS t-shirt NO BID 8.95 NOBID 14.95 NO BID
Event Polo SS 28.00 NOBID 25.65 25.75
Spec. Ops SS Polo NO BID NOBID 29.00 NO BID
Spec. Ops LS Polo NO BID NOBID 45.35 NO BID
Tactical Pants 28.50 28.50 28.20 29.99
Tactical Shorts 24.00 24.40 23.50 24.98

SPECIAL OPS JOB SHIRT 61.55

Mr. Keith Powell requested the bids be taken under advisement so he can prepare a
spreadsheet comparing the bids.



“Commissioner Shafer moved, seconded by Commissioner Cook, to take the bids under
advisement. The motion passed unanimously.”

DRUGS & MEDICAL SUPPLIES — PAWS

The following companies submitted bids for this item and due to their volume, the
originals may be viewed in the County Mayor’s Office during regular business hours:

Med-Vet International, Mettawa, IL

MWI Veterinary Supply, Boise, ID

Merritt Veterinary Supplies, Columbia, SC
Patterson Veterinary, Pelham, AL

HON=

Mr. Michael Gregory requested the bids be taken under advisement so he can provide a
spreadsheet comparing the bids for the Purchasing Committee at its meeting on August
27, 2014. He advised he will be out of town but will submit his recommendation to Vicki
Taylor and send a representative.

“Commissioner Shafer moved, seconded by Commissioner Cook, to take the bids under
advisement. The motion passed unanimously.”

% TON CHASSIS WITH EXTENDED CAB — PAWS

1. Russell Barnett Ford, Winchester, TN Ford F250 $22,553.02
2. Beaman Automotive Group, Nashville Ford F250 $22,353.00
3. Golden Circle Ford, Jackson, TN Ford F250  $22,030.00
4. Chev-Buick-GMC-Cad. Of Murf. Chevrolet Silverado $24,774.36
9. Ford of Murfreesboro Ford F250 $22,140.00

Mr. Michael Gregory reviewed the bids thoroughly and said the Ford of Murfreesboro
bid included $125.00 for 4 upfitter switches that he does not need:; therefore, if you take
$125.00 out of the $22,140 submitted by Ford of Murfreesboro, that makes their bid
$22,015, which is the lowest bid and a local company.

“Commissioner Cook moved, seconded by Commissioner Black, to award the low bid to
Ford of Murfreesboro for a Ford F250 at $22,015 (which is minus the 4 upfitter
switches). The motion passed unanimously.”



COMPUTER-ASSISTED MASS APPRAISAL (CAMA) SYSTEM — ASSESSOR OF
PROPERTY

1. Patriot Properties, Inc., Marblehead, MA

Annual Cost for 5 Year Term $99,000.00
Yearly Maintenance after 5 Yr Term $55,000.00
(Starting on Yr 6)
Cost over 10 Years $787,002.47
2. E-Ring, Inc., Alpharetta, GA
Whole County Pricing $250,000.00
Yearly Maintenance Cost $ 75,000.00

Mr. Rob Mitchell, along with Brian Robertson, Barbara Marlin, and Darin Moore,
reviewed each bid and reported back that Patriot Properties is the low bid overall,
When they figured up the projected ten year cost for E-Ring, the total was $947,008.05
which is higher than $787,002.47 bid by Patriot. Also, Patriot Properties is the preferred
vendors for Davidson, Hamilton, Loudon and many other Tennessee counties. They
are well versed with GIS and meet all specifications. Therefore, it was Mr. Mitchell and
OIT’s recommendations to award the bid to Patriot Properties.

“Commissioner Shafer moved, seconded by Commissioner Cook, to award the bid to
Patriot Properties. The motion passed unanimously.”

ELECTRONIC WASTE DISPOSAL — SOLID WASTE

One bid was received.

Dynamic Recycling, Nashville, TN

CRT/Projection/LCD Televisions 24 per #
CRT Monitors 24 per #
Desktop PC’s 15 per #
Laptop PC’s .30 per #
Servers 15 per #
Misc. Mixed Computer Components .01 per #
Household Appliances Free of charge
Lead Acid Batteries .20 per #
Electronic Wire .60 per #
AJ/C Adapters (with or without wire) A2 per #
Uninterrupted power supplies w/battery 10 per #

Mac Nolen requested the bid be taken under advisement. He would like to do more
research before awarding the bid.

“Commissioner Cook moved, seconded by Commissioner McAdoo, to take the bid
under advisement. The motion passed unanimously.”



HEAVY DUTY OUTSIDE RAIL TYPE ROLL-OFF HOIST & CHASSIS — SOLID WASTE

1. Neely Coble Co., Nashville, TN 2015 Freightliner $135,575.00
2. Alley-Cassetty Truck Ctr., Nashville 2015 Western Star $134,807.00
3. Mack of Nashville 2015 Mack GU813 $136,795.81
Alternate bid for 2015 & 2016 $134,223.00

GUB813 with MP7 Maxidyne 405HP.
4, Rush Truck Ctr., Smyrna, TN 2015 Peterbilt 567 $146,061.00
5. Stringfellow, Nashville, TN 2015 Western Star $139,833.00
2015 Freightliner 114SD  $133,977.00
2015 Mack GU813 $134,991.00
2015/16 GU813 $132,363.00

Mr. Nolen requested the bids be taken under advisement.

“Commissioner Shafer moved, seconded by Commissioner McAdoo, to take the bids
under advisement. The motion passed unanimously.”

There being no further business at this time, the meeting was adjourned at 5:35 p.m.
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ERNEST G. BURGESS, CHAIRMAN




