PURCHASING COMMITTEE

AUGUST 7, 2013 4:30 P.M.

MINUTES
MEMBERS OTHERS
Ernest Burgess, Chairman Keith Powell
Carol Cook Anthony Tuggle
Joyce Ealy Brian Gaither
Trey Gooch Jacoby O’'Gwynne
Jack Black Mike Bailey
Doug Shafer Vicki Taylor

Allen McAdoo
Chairman Burgess called the meeting to order at 4:30 p.m.

UP TO 4 AMBULANCE STRETCHERS — EMERGENCY MEDICAL SERVICES

1. Stryker Medical, Portage, Ml 4 @ $6,229.60 = $24,918.40
2. Select Tech, Shelbyville, TN 4 @ $7,963.00 = $31,852.00

Brian Gaither from the EMS reviewed the bids and recommended awarding the low bid to Stryker.

“Commissioner Cook moved, seconded by Commissioner Gooch, to award the low bid to Stryker. The
motion passed unanimously.”

UNIFORMS — EMERGNECY MEDICAL SERVICES

Ted’s Next Level Gall's CMS Bluegrass
LS SHIRT $22.50/%$24.50 $27.25/%$38 $28.25 $23.42
SS SHIRT $21.00/%$23.00 $23.50/%$32.98 $24.75 $26.72
8" BOOT $59.50 $59.00 $76.00 $67.50 $64.12
6" BOOT $59.50 $62.00 $70.95 $63.75 $61.42
SHOE $52.00 $53.50 $58.75 $47.50 $53.72
WIN. JACKET $44.00/$46.00 $22.75/%$26.75 $45.00 $53.72
RAINCOAT $35.00/%37.00 NO BID $35.00 $33.72
FL. JACKET $33.00/$37.00 NO BID NO BID $30.00
NAVY CAP NO BID NO BID $9.00 $4.00/7.72
TOBOGGAN NO BID $5.80 $8.00 $5.92
BEANIE NO BID NO BID $8.00 $6.42
BELTS $14.00 $15.30/%$22.30 $15.00 $12.72/14.22
SS SHIRT $12.00 NO BID NO BID $6.72
LS SHIRT $14.00 NO BID NO BID $7.72
SS T-SHIRT NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.72
SS EV. POLO $28.00/$30.00 $19.25/$20.50 NO BID $26.00
SS POLO $29.50/%$32.50 $24.60/%$28.20 NO BID $30.00
LS POLO $32.50/%$35.50 $32.90/%$40.00 NO BID $34.42
JOB SHIRT NO BID $48.20/$58.40 NO BID $51.72
TACT. PANTS $33.90 $27.50 $28.50 $30.32
TACT. SHORTS $32.00 $34.25/%44 .50 $24.50 $24 .72

Keith Powell with the EMS requested the bids be taken under advisement so he can prepare a
spreadsheet.



“Commissioner Shafer moved, seconded by Commissioner Cook, to take the bids under advisement so
Keith Powell can prepare a spreadsheet to bring back before the Committee. The motion passed
unanimously.”

LIVESTOCK PENS — LANE AGRI PARK

Rutherford Co-Op, Murfreesboro, TN:
1. Custom Quad Pen $13,020.00
2. Priefert Panels, Gates & Adapter  $18,422.52

Mr. Anthony Tuggle requested taking the two bids under advisement because he is not familiar with the
Priefert bid submitted by the Co-Op.

“Commissioner Cook moved, seconded by Commissioner Gooch, to take the bids under advisement.
The motion passed unanimously.”

ITEMS UNDER ADVISEMENT

VEHICLE EQUIPMENT, STRIPING & VEHICLE BUILD — SHERIFF’'S OFFICE

Seven bids were received and opened on this item on July 18, 2013 and taken under advisement. Major
Jacoby O’Gwynne and Sgt. Mike Bailey provided the Committee with a spreadsheet of all items bid and
advised it was their recommendation to award the bid to Trucker’s Lighthouse. Policecars Orlando out of
Apopka, FL had only bid the striping, which was lower, but the customer service is not local and they can’t
drive a car to FL just to have striping repaired or put on. That was the only item that was not the lowest
bid and they recommended awarding the striping as well to Trucker’s Lighthouse because they are a local
company and are lower on all other items.

“Commissioner Black moved, seconded by Commissioner Cook, to accept the recommendation of Major
O’Gwynne and Sgt. Bailey and award the complete bid package to Trucker’s Lighthouse. The motion
passed unanimously.”

POLICE PURSUIT AND NON-POLICE PURSUIT VEHICLES — SHERIFF'S OFFICE

Four bids were received and opened on this item on July 18, 2013 and taken under advisement. Major
Jacoby O’Gwynne and Sgt. Mike Bailey provided the Committee with a spreadsheet of all vehicles bid
and it was their recommendation to award the bids as follows:

Ford of Murfreesboro

1. Ford Interceptor PPV (P2L) $22,102.00
2. Ford Interceptor PPV (PSM) $23,100.00
3. Ford Utility PPV (K8A) $25,087.00
4. Ford Fusion (POG) $17,000.00
5. Ford Explorer (K7B) $23,800.00
6. Ford Explorer (K8B) $24,400.00
7. Ford Expedition (U1f-SSV) $25,999.00
8. Ford Expedition (U1G-SSV) $28,600.00
9. Ford F-150 (X1C) $17,700.00
10. Ford F-150 (X1E) $19,900.00
11. Ford F-150 (F1C) $15,273.00
12. Ford F-150 (F1E) $18,230.00
13. Ford F-150 (X1C) $17,700.00
14. Ford F-150 (X1E) $19,900.00

15. Ford F-150 (W1C) $19,500.00



16. Ford F-150 (W1E)
17. Ford F-250 (F2A)
18. Ford F-250 (F2B)
19. Ford F-250 (X2B)
20. Ford F-250 (W2A)
21. Ford F-250 (W2B)
22. Ford F350 (F3A)
23. Ford F350 (F3B)
24. Ford F350 (X3A)
25. Ford F350 (X3B)
26. Ford F350 (W3A)
27. Ford F350 (W3A)
28. Ford E250 (E2E)
29. Ford E250 (S2E)
30. Ford E350 (E3E)
31. Ford E350 (S3E)
32. Ford E350 (S3B)
33. Ford C-Max Hybrid
34. Ford Fusion Hybrid

Golden Circle Ford

1. Ford F-250 (X2A)
2. Ford C-Max (SLB)

Dodge of Columbia

. Jeep Patriot (MKTE74)

. Jeep Patriot (MKJE74)

. Dodge Durango (WDDL75)

. Dodge Durango (WDEL75)

. Dodge Grand Caravan (RJKH53)

~NOoO Ok~ WNE

Chevrolet of Murfreesboro

$23,900.00
$18,600.00
$21,000.00
$22,607.00
$21,673.00
$23,826.00
$19,500.00
$22,000.00
$21,800.00
$24,200.00
$23,000.00
$25,473.00
$17,700.00
$19,309.00
$20,000.00
$21,000.00
$23,234.00
$22,100.00
$23,165.00

$20,283.00
$22,382.00

. Dodge Charger PPV (LDDEA48) (V6) $22,567.00
. Dodge Charger PPV (LDDEA48) (V8) $23,485.00

$14,388.00
$16,387.00
$25,461.00
$29,587.00
$20,379.00

1. Chevrolet Caprice PPV (1EW19)(1SB) $27,030.00
2. Chevrolet Caprice PPV (1EW19)(1SC) $27,030.00
3. Chevrolet Impala PPV (1IEW19) (9C1) $19,945.00
4. Chevrolet Impala PPV (1IEW19) (9C3) $19,945.00
5. Chevrolet Tahoe PPV (CC10706) (2WD) $25,907.00
6. Chevrolet Tahoe PPV (CC10706) (4WD) $28,212.00

The initial contract period for this bid is from the date of the bid award until September 30, 2014. All bid
prices shall be effective until September 30, 2014. The second, third, fourth and fifth periods will be
effective from October 1 through September 30 of each respective period. Successful bidder shall submit
price increases sixty (60) days (August 1 of each respective period) prior to becoming effective during any
of the contract periods for approval and acceptance by the County Mayor.

“Commissioner Shafer moved, seconded by Commissioner Gooch, to award the bids as recommended
on the spreadsheet provided by Major O’Gwynne. The motion passed unanimously.”

There being no further business at this time, Chairman Burgess declared the meeting adjourned at 5:06

p.m.



ERNEST G. BURGESS, CHAIRMAN



