Date: 6/02/2015
Time: 09:08

Department: RCT

Bank --Number--

FSB 11
FSB 12
CPT 4
FVI 13

Totals For CD

LGP 1
LGP 4
LGP 2
LGP 10
LGP 9
LGP 5
LGP 6
LGP 8
LGP 3

Totals For LGIP
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[RUTHERFORD CO TRUSTEE

CD#84145

CD#84280

CD#549000003528

CD#11952

Investment:

Projected Interest:

Interest:

LGIP GENERAL #275236

LGIP DRUG FUND 122

LGIP SCH NUTRITION 143

LGIP #10

LGIP #9

]

Type Acct
CD CD
CD CD
CD CD
CD CD

43,000,000.00

215,637.07

LGIP LGIP

LGIP LGIP

LGIP LGIP

LGIP LGIP

LGIP LGIP

LGIP 2012 SCHOOLS & GEN P LGIP LGIP

LGIP #6

LGIP #8

LGIP #3

Investment:

Projected Interest:

Interest:

Investment:

Projected Interest:

Interest:

LGIP LGIP

LGIP LGIP

Rutherford Co. Trustee Page: 1
Investments - By Account Type Id: IM1651
For Period: 06/02/2015 To 12/31/2017
-CUSIP No- Invt/Renew Mature/Can -Days- --Rate-- -Investment-- -Project/Int-
8/19/2014 8/19/2015 365 0.5000 5,000,000.00 25,347.22
9/23/2014 9/23/2015 365 0.4600 10,000,000.00 46,638.89
10/30/2014 10/30/2015 365 0.5000 25,000,000.00 125,000.00
3/03/2015 3/03/2016 366 0.6200 3,000,000.00 18,650.96
6/30/1994 34,960,648.30
10/02/1995 856,960.36
10/24/2007 3,418,321.01
3/15/2010 323 109,250.14
1/18/2011 380 5,454.79
1/19/2012 379
10/31/2013 354,232.58
5/28/2014 249 7,813,205.70
4/16/2015 291 49,219,916.78

LGIP LGIP

96,737,989.66

139,737,989.66
215,637.07

.09



L y 4,2015

TO: BUDGET, FINANCE & INVESTMENT COMMITTEE
FROM: TEB BATEY, TRUSTEE

Bid Date: 5/4/15
Eagleville Valedictorian Scholarship %’

L = o COMPETITIVE RATE QUOTES
Bank of America-Robert Wyatt 90 Days No Bid F & M BANK---NATHAN SANDERS
PH 1-404-264-3642 ext 3642 6 Months PH 867-9728 FAX 867-9738
FAX 1-404-720-9690 1Year email nathan.sanders@myfmbank.com

email robert.t.wyatt@baml.com

FIRST TENN BANK—PHIL HOLT 90 Days NO BID FIRST VISION BANK--CHRIS HENSON
PH 893-7210 FAX 890-8149 6 Months PH 494-5950 FAX 494-5951
email pcholt@firsttennessee.com 1Year email chenson@firstvisionbank.com

cc tdholmes@ftb.com

COMPETITIVE RATE QUOTES

90 Days NO BID
6 Months
1Year

90 Days no bid
6 Months

1 Year

*Went with Franklin Synergy for

REGIONS—MAGY MENNE 90 Days
PH 904-2851 FAX 904-2848 6 Months
email magdalena.menne@regions.com 1Year 0.05
1year @ .70 %

SUNTRUST BANK—BRIAN WILLIAMS 90 Days NO BID
r 120 FAX 748-5161 6 Months
e .an.lLwilliams@suntrust.com 1Year
FIRST BANK-—Leighann Maxwell 90 Days NO BID
PH 890-1111 FAX 907-8940 6 Months
email Imaxwell@firstbankonline.com 1Year
PINNACLE—RENE JENNINGS 90 Days NO BID
PH 849-3362 FAX 849-3300 6 Months
email rene.jennings@pnfp.com 1Year
FRANKLIN SYNERGY-DALLAS CAUDLE 90 Days
PH 278-7100 FAX 278-7303 6 Months
email dallas.caudle@franklinsynergy.com 1 Year 0.70 *
GAPITAL BANK--MATT LEDBETTER 90 Days
PH 278-1040 FAX 278-1085 6 Months
email matt.ledbetter@capitalbank-us.com 1Year 0.35
US BANK—STEVEN CHAPEL 90 Days NO BID
PH 904-2965 FAX 896-6608 6 Months
email steven.chapel@usbank.com 1Year

. BANK & TRUST—Colleen Blane 90 Days NO BID
PH 904-6350 FAX 867-4554 6 Months

email cblane@wilsonbank.com 1Year




